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ENVIRONMENTAL POLICY STATEMENT 

 
Ecospec Pty Ltd specialises in remediation durability and protection of marine and 
coastal infrastructure. 
 
Working over and adjacent to water places unique demands on environmental 
management.  The projects we undertake are often in sensitive natural environments 
and our goal is always to complete our works without any impact on these 
environments. 
 
The management of Ecospec also believe that they have an obligation to play a role in 
contributing to the challenge of environmental issues such as climate change, 
deforestation, wildlife preservation and pollution of habitats at a local, national and 
global level. 
 
The Ecospec objectives to achieve these goals are to 

• Establish procedures which minimize the environmental impact of our works and 
ensure the prevention of pollution resulting from our activities 

• Undertake audits and inspections of our work sites as per the Project Specific 
Environmental Management Plans. 

• Carry out risk assessments for all construction activities, addressing 
environmental risks in particular and ensuring that controls are put in place to 
keep work activities as “low environmental risk”. 

• Consider the environmental impacts of all purchasing decisions to ensure that 
environmental effects are taken into account in the procurement process. 

• Develop, use and update management procedures which comply with the 
requirements of AS/NZS ISO 14001:2015. 

• As a minimum, operate in compliance with all contractual and relevant statutory 
obligations, including particular requirements of our clients and the communities 
in which we work. 

• Review our performance against core objectives in the Environmental 
Management Plan and take appropriate action when necessary. 

• Communicate our goals and objectives effectively within the organization through 
training, inductions and prominent display  

• Adequately address training needs to enhance the level of skill and competence 
within our organization 

• Review this policy on an annual basis to ensure that it is adequate and effective 

The Company management is committed to the development and implementation of 
the integrated management system and continually improving its effectiveness. 
 
We will incorporate these objectives into every aspect of our business activities and 
monitor our performance to ensure we are delivering projects in accordance with 
these principles. 
 
Managing Director:  
 

 
 
Date: 14/02/2020 


